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Question: Minister, for each NT aquifer, please provide details of
sustainable yield, total volume of approved water extraction
licenses and number of unprocessed water extraction licenses,

including total volume of water applied for.

Answer: The details of sustainable yield, total volume of water extraction
licences issued, number of pending applications including volume
applied for is provided for each aquifer system.

The sustainable yield for some aquifers is identified as 'to be
confirmed' where detailed analysis of previous calculations of aquifer
storage, recharge and river baseflows is required and will be
undertaken when licences are renewed or when new licence
applications are received.

Where the sustainable yield for some aquifers is identified as 'Yet to
determined' assessment of aquifer storage, recharge and river base
flows has commenced as part of licence application processing.

The modelling of the Oolloo Dolostone in the Daly Roper Water
Control District has identified that by applying the environmental flow
rules proposed in the draft Oolloo Aquifer Water Allocation Plan the
sustainable yield of this linked aquifer/river system is greater than
60,OOOML/year. However, achieving extractions greater than
60,OOOML is highly influenced by seasonal rainfall variability and the
reliability of achieving full allocations needs to be considered by
potential users. Advice on reliability is published with all licences
granted. Annual announced allocations for all licences are made for
the express purpose of ensuring scientifically established
environmental flow thresholds are never threatened in the Katherine
River and Daly River.
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